
STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA 
OFFICE OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT 

523 EAST CAPITOL AVENUE 
PIERRE, SOUTH DAKOTA 57501-3182 

 
IFB 200  

RENTAL CONTRACT SHOP TOWELS, CARPETS, AND MOPS – ANNUAL 
 

 
NOTICE 

ADDENDUM 2 
 

DATE: April 14, 2016 
BUYER: Lisa Hubbard 
PHONE: 605-773-4580 
 
VENDORS: 
 
SERVALL UNIFORM & LINEN SUPPLY  AMERIPRIDE 
312 Main Street 206 North Pacific Avenue  
Rapid City, SD 57709  Fargo, ND 58102 
Contact: Kirk Dulany Contact: Keith Hovelson 
Phone: (605) 343-0680 Phone: (701) 232-7484 
Fax:     None Available  Fax:     (701) 232-9257 
Vendor #12049672 Vendor #12021245 
E-mail: Kirk.Dulany@Servall.net E-mail: keith.hovelson@ameripride.com  
CONTRACT #16821 CONTRACT #16822 
  
DUDLEY LAUNDRY DBA APPEARA  
126 North 3rd Street  
Norfolk, NE  68701  
Contact: Brian Larson  
Phone: (877) 371-9715  
Fax: (402) 371-9773  
Email: blarson@appeara.com  
Vendor #12057489  
Contract: 16823  
 
 
Addendum 2 is being issued for the following:  
 
Contracts have been extended from July 1, 2016 to June 30, 2017.    
 
All terms and conditions specified on the contract remain unchanged.   
  

 
Steven L. Berg, Director 
Office of Procurement Management 

mailto:keith.hovelson@ameripride.com
mailto:blarson@appeara.com


STATE OF SOUTH DAKOTA 
OFFICE OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT 

523 EAST CAPITOL AVENUE 
PIERRE, SOUTH DAKOTA 57501-3182 

IFB 200  
RENTAL CONTRACT SHOP TOWELS, CARPETS, AND MOPS – ANNUAL 

NOTICE 
ADDENDUM 1 

DATE: July 9, 2015 
BUYER: Lisa Hubbard 
PHONE: 605-773-4580 

VENDORS: 

SERVALL UNIFORM & LINEN SUPPLY AMERIPRIDE 
312 Main Street 206 North Pacific Avenue 
Rapid City, SD 57709  Fargo, ND 58102 
Contact: Gary Stanley Contact: Keith Hovelson 
Phone: (605) 343-0680 Phone: (701) 232-7484 
Fax:     None Available  Fax:     (701) 232-9257 
Vendor #12049672 Vendor #12021245 
E-mail: gary.stanley@servall.net E-mail: keith.hovelson@ameripride.com
CONTRACT #16821 CONTRACT #16822

DUDLEY LAUNDRY DBA APPEARA 
126 North 3rd Street 
Norfolk, NE  68701 
Contact: Brian Larson 
Phone: (877) 371-9715 
Fax: (402) 371-9773 
Email: blarson@appeara.com 
Vendor #12057489 
Contract: 16823 

Addendum 1 is being issued for the following:  

Zone 4 has been awarded to Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara.    

All terms and conditions specified on the contract remain unchanged.  

Steven L. Berg, Director 
Office of Procurement Management 

mailto:gary.stanley@servall.net
mailto:keith.hovelson@ameripride.com
mailto:blarson@appeara.com


RENTAL CONTRACT  
SHOP TOWELS, CARPETS, AND MOPS - ANNUAL 

NOTICE OF AWARDS 

Buyer: Lisa Hubbard (014) 
Phone: 605-773-4580
Fax: 605-773-4840
Email: Lisa.Hubbard@state.sd.us

Date: June 29, 2015 

1. Contract Term:  This notice establishes contract(s) resulting from IFB # 200 for a period of one (1)
year, from July 1, 2015 through June 30, 2016 inclusive.   The IFB and the vendor’s response, along
with the South Dakota Vendor’s Manual are made part of the vendor’s contract by this reference.

2. Extension:  The State may, at its own discretion, extend a contract for an additional two (2) months
past the original contract expiration date.  The State may renew this contract for up to four (4)
additional one (1) year periods.  Notice shall be given by the State to the vendor at least 60 days prior
to the termination of the contract, and the vendor shall agree to such extension within 30 days
thereafter, before such extension period shall become effective.

3. Pricing:  All prices quoted in the referenced proposal are firm for the term of this contract. Price
decreases are acceptable on invoice(s) presented for payment.  If the open market price of a specific
contract item is under the vendor’s price, the State reserves the right to purchase the lower priced
product.

4. Delivery:  The contractor shall furnish and deliver all of the awarded items of supplies, equipment,
and commodities enumerated in the schedules and specifications, at the price and according to the
terms and conditions, and of the kind, quality, and amounts and at the times specified in the
schedules and specifications.  The supplies, equipment and commodities shall be delivered to the
Director of the Office of Procurement Management or to such State Department or State agency as
he shall direct and such delivery shall be made without cost to the State.

5. In the event of the inability or failure of the contractor to furnish and deliver any item or items
enumerated in the schedules and specifications at the time and in accordance with the terms and
conditions therein provided, the Director of the Office of Procurement Management may contract for
or purchase such supplies, equipment, and commodities in the open market and the contractor shall
make good the excess over the price named in the schedule and specifications and the cost of such
supplies, equipment, and commodities in the open market provided however, that the foregoing
provisions shall not apply where other penalties for any default in the performance of the conditions of
this contract are provided for in the schedules and specifications.

PMB 01231 
BUREAU OF ADMINISTRATION 
OFFICE OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT 
523 EAST CAPITOL 
PIERRE, SD 57501-3182 
(605) 773-3405
FAX (605) 773-4840



6. All orders shall be shipped F.O.B. destination.  Delivery and pick-up made every one to two weeks.

7. All delivery tickets, invoices and statements shall show the purchase order number, brand or trade
name and State Item Number when applicable as shown in this contract.  Invoices must be submitted
in duplicate to the State Agency ordering the merchandise.  DO NOT SUBMIT STATEMENTS OR
INVOICES TO THE OFFICE OF PROCUREMENT MANAGEMENT AS IT ONLY DELAYS
PAYMENT.

8. Unless otherwise indicated, payment for items on the contract(s) may be made with the South
Dakota Purchasing Card (Citibank Master Card). State agencies may use the Purchasing Card
when making purchases of $1000.00 or less per transaction.

Steven L. Berg, Director  
Office of Procurement Management 

Bookmarks 

Contractors



CONTRACTORS 

Servall Uniform & Linen Supply 
312 Main Street 
Rapid City, SD  57709 

Contact:  Gary Stanley 
Phone:    (605) 343-0680 
Fax:        None Available 
Email:     gary.stanley@servall.net 
Vendor #12049672 
Contract: 16821 

Ameripride 
206 Northern Pacific Avenue 
Fargo, ND 58102 

Contact: Keith Hovelson 
Phone: (701) 232-7484 
Fax: (701) 232-9257 
Email: keith.hovelson@ameripride.com 
Vendor #12021245  
Contract: 16822 

mailto:gary.stanley@servall.net
mailto:keith.hovelson@ameripride.com


Line Number Description Vendor Item Manufacturer 
& Part Number Product Number Bid Price

ZONE 1 - ENTRY CARPETS
1 Entry Carpet 2' x 3' - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 350304 1.71$           
2 Entry Carpet 3' x 4' - Zone 1 NO BID
3 Entry Carpet 3' x 5 - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 330502 2.47$           
4 Entry Carpet 4' x 6' - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 340615 3.96$           
5 Entry Carpet 4' x 8' - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 340810 5.28$           
6 Entry Carpet 3' x 10' - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 331024 4.95$           
7 Entry Carpet 4' x 10' - Zone 1 NO BID
8 Entry Carpet 4' x 12' - Zone 1 NO BID

ZONE 2 - ENTRY CARPETS
9 Entry Carpet 2' x 3' - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 350304 1.71$           
10 Entry Carpet 3' x 4' - Zone 2 NO BID
11 Entry Carpet 3' x 5' - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 330502 2.47$           
12 Entry Carpet 4' x 6' - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 340615 3.96$           
13 Entry Carpet 4' x 8' - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 340810 5.28$           
14 Entry Carpet 3' x 10' - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 331024 4.95$           
15 Entry Carpet 4' x 10' - Zone 2 NO BID
16 Entry Carpet 4' x 12' - Zone 2 NO BID

ZONE 3 - ENTRY CARPETS
17 Entry Carpet 2' x 3' - Zone 3 AmeriPride Mountville Mills MN06 0.84$           
18 Entry Carpet 3' x 4' - Zone 3 NO BID
19 Entry Carpet 3' x 5' - Zone 3 AmeriPride Mountville Mills MN15 2.10$           
20 Entry Carpet 4' x 6' - Zone 3 AmeriPride Mountville Mills MN24 3.36$           
21 Entry Carpet 4' x 8' - Zone 3 AmeriPride Mountville Mills MN32 4.48$           
22 Entry Carpet 3' x 10' - Zone 3 AmeriPride Mountville Mills MN30 4.20$           
23 Entry Carpet 4' x 10' - Zone 3 NO BID
24 Entry Carpet 4' x 12' - Zone 3 NO BID

ZONE 4 - ENTRY CARPETS
25 Entry Carpet 2' x 3' - Zone 4 Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Mountville Mills MN06 2.25$           
26 Entry Carpet 3' x 4' - Zone 4 NO BID
27 Entry Carpet 3' x 5' - Zone 4 Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Mountville Mills MN15 4.25$           
28 Entry Carpet 4' x 6' - Zone 4 Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Mountville Mills MN24 6.25$           
29 Entry Carpet 4' x 8' - Zone 4 NO BID
30 Entry Carpet 3' x 10' - Zone 4 Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Mountville Mills MN30 7.75$           
31 Entry Carpet 4' x 10' - Zone 4 NO BID
32 Entry Carpet 4' x 12' - Zone 4 NO BID

ALL ZONES - ENTRY CARPET LOST OR DAMAGED



33 Entry Carpet 2' x 3' Lost or Damaged Replacement Cost - 
All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 350304 27.12$         

AmeriPride Mountville Mills MN06 21.08$         

34 Entry Carpet 3' x 4' Lost or Damaged Replacement Cost - 
All Zones NO BID

35 Entry Carpet 3' x 5' Lost or Damaged Replacement Cost - 
All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 330502 62.88$         

AmeriPride Mountville Mills MN15 52.26$         
Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Mountville Mills 42.50$         

36 Entry Carpet 4' x 6' Lost or Damaged Replacement Cost - 
All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 331024 92.52$         

AmeriPride Mountville Mills MN24 64.47$         
Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Mountville Mills 71.00$         

37 Entry Carpet 4' x 8' Lost or Damaged Replacement Cost - 
All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 340810 123.12$       

AmeriPride Mountville Mills MN32 91.63$         

38 Entry Carpet 3' x 10' Lost or Damaged Replacement Cost - 
All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Mountville Mills 331024 122.60$       

AmeriPride Mountville Mills MN30 84.55$         
Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Mountville Mills 96.10$         

39 Entry Carpet 4' x 10' Lost or Damaged Replacement Cost - 
All Zones NO BID

40 Entry Carpet 4' x 12' Lost or Damaged Replacement Cost - 
All Zones NO BID

SHOP TOWELS
41 Shop Towels - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Hunt Textiles 203001 0.10$           
42 Shop Towels - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Hunt Textiles 203001 0.10$           
43 Shop Towels - Zone 3 AmeriPride ST18ORG 0.09$           
44 Shop Towels - Zone 4 NO BID

45 Shop Towels Lost or Damaged Replacement Cost - All 
Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Hunt Textiles 203001 0.36$           

AmeriPride ST18ORG 0.66$           

DUST MOP HEADS - ZONE 1
46 Dust Mop Heads 12" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320012 1.20$           
47 Dust Mop Heads 18" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320012 1.80$           
48 Dust Mop Heads 24" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320024 2.40$           
49 Dust Mop Heads 36" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320030 3.00$           
50 Dust Mop Heads 48" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320042 4.20$           
51 Dust Mop Heads 60" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320060 6.00$           

DUST MOP HEADS - ZONE 2
52 Dust Mop Heads 12" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320012 1.20$           
53 Dust Mop Heads 18" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320018 1.80$           



54 Dust Mop Heads 24" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg. 320024 2.40$           
55 Dust Mop Heads 36" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320030 3.00$           
56 Dust Mop Heads 48" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320042 4.20$           
57 Dust Mop Heads 60" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320060 6.00$           

DUST MOP HEADS - ZONE 3
58 Dust Mop Heads 12" - Zone 3 AmeriPride Golden Star MP12GST 0.78$           
59 Dust Mop Heads 18" - Zone 3 NO BID
60 Dust Mop Heads 24" - Zone 3 AmeriPride Golden Star MP24GST 1.56$           
61 Dust Mop Heads 36" - Zone 3 AmeriPride Golden Star MP36GST 2.34$           
62 Dust Mop Heads 48" - Zone 3 AmeriPride Golden Star MP48GST 3.12$           
63 Dust Mop Heads 60" - Zone 3 AmeriPride Golden Star MP60GST 3.90$           

DUST MOP HEADS - ZONE 4
64 Dust Mop Heads 12" - Zone 4 NO BID
65 Dust Mop Heads 18" - Zone 4 NO BID
66 Dust Mop Heads 24" - Zone 4 Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Golden Star 2.25$           
67 Dust Mop Heads 36" - Zone 4 Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Golden Star 3.00$           
68 Dust Mop Heads 48" - Zone 4 Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Golden Star 3.40$           
69 Dust Mop Heads 60" - Zone 4 Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Golden Star 3.75$           

DUST MOPS HEADS - LOST OR DAMAGED 
REPLACEMENT COST - ALL ZONES

70 Dust Mop Heads 12" - Lost or Damaged Replacement 
Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg. 320012 8.96$           

AmeriPride Golden Star MP12GST 9.05$           

71 Dust Mop Heads 18" - Lost or Damaged Replacement 
Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320018 14.56$         

72 Dust Mop Heads 24" - Lost or Damaged Replacement 
Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320024 9.68$           

AmeriPride Golden Star MP24GST 10.60$         
Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Golden Star MP24GST 9.60$           

73 Dust Mop Heads 36" - Lost or Damaged Replacement 
Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320030 11.88$         

AmeriPride Golden Star MP36GST 16.20$         
Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Golden Star MP36GST 7.50$           

74 Dust Mop Heads 48" - Lost or Damaged Replacement 
Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320042 15.00$         

AmeriPride Golden Star MP48GST 21.60$         
Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Golden Star MP48GST 12.00$         

75 Dust Mop Heads 60" - Lost or Damaged Replacement 
Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320060 21.78$         

AmeriPride Golden Star MP60GST 27.00$         
Dudley Laundry DBA Appeara Golden Star MP60GST 15.00$         

DUST MOP HANDLES/FRAMES - ZONE 1
76 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 12" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003212 0.10$           



77 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 18" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003218 0.10$           
78 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 24" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003224 0.10$           
79 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 36" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003230 0.10$           
80 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 48" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003242 0.10$           
81 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 60" - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 320060 0.10$           

DUST MOP HANDLES/FRAMES - ZONE 2
82 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 12" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003212 0.10$           
83 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 18" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003218 0.10$           
84 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 24" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003224 0.10$           
85 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 36" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003230 0.10$           
86 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 48" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003242 0.10$           
87 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 60" - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003260 0.10$           

DUST MOP HANDLES/FRAMES - ZONE 3
88 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 12" - Zone 3 AmeriPride Dry Mop Handle MP18HDL 0.25$           
89 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 18" - Zone 3 NO BID
90 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 24" - Zone 3 AmeriPride Dry Mop Handle MP18HDL 0.25$           
91 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 36" - Zone 3 AmeriPride Dry Mop Handle MP18HDL 0.25$           
92 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 48" - Zone 3 AmeriPride Dry Mop Handle MP18HDL 0.25$           
93 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 60" - Zone 3 AmeriPride Dry Mop Handle MP18HDL 0.25$           

DUST MOP HANDLES/FRAMES - ZONE 4
94 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 12" - Zone 4 NO BID
95 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 18" - Zone 4 NO BID
96 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 24" - Zone 4 NO BID
97 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 36" - Zone 4 NO BID
98 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 48" - Zone 4 NO BID
99 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 60" - Zone 4 NO BID

DUST MOP HANDLES/FRAMES - LOST OR DAMAGED 
REPLACEMENT COST - ALL ZONES

100 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 12" - Lost or Damaged 
Replacement Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003212 26.88$         

AmeriPride Dry Mop Handle MP18HDL 12.78$         

101 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 18" - Lost or Damaged 
Replacement Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003218 35.35$         

102 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 24" - Lost or Damaged 
Replacement Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003224 22.95$         

AmeriPride Dry Mop Handle MP18HDL 12.78$         

103 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 36" - Lost or Damaged 
Replacement Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003230 23.84$         

AmeriPride Dry Mop Handle MP18HDL 12.78$         

104 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 48" - Lost or Damaged 
Replacement Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003242 27.70$         

AmeriPride Dry Mop Handle MP18HDL 12.78$         



105 Dust Mop Handles/Frames 60" - Lost or Damaged 
Replacement Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003260 35.44$         

AmeriPride Dry Mop Handle MP18HDL 12.78$         

WET MOP HEADS - SIZE MEDIUM
106 Wet Mop Heads - Size Medium - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Advantex 003078 1.80$           
107 Wet Mop Heads - Size Medium - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Advantex 003078 1.80$           
108 Wet Mop Heads - Size Medium - Zone 3 AmeriPride Golden Star MPWMMDG 1.93$           
109 Wet Mop Heads - Size Medium - Zone 4 NO BID

110 Wet Mop Heads - Size Medium - Lost or Damaged 
Replacement Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Advantex 003078 11.70$         

AmeriPride Golden Star MPWMMDG 15.62$         

WET MOP HEADS - SIZE LARGE
111 Wet Mop Heads - Size Large - Zone 1 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003089 2.00$           
112 Wet Mop Heads - Size Large - Zone 2 Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003089 2.00$           
113 Wet Mop Heads - Size Large - Zone 3 AmeriPride Golden Star MPWMMDG 1.93$           
114 Wet Mop Heads - Size Large - Zone 4 NO BID

115 Wet Mop Heads - Size Large - Lost or Damaged 
Replacement Cost - All Zones Servall Uniform & Linen Supply Golden Star Mfg 003089 12.60$         

AmeriPride Golden Star MPWMMDG 15.62$         

WET MOP HEADS - 100% COTTON - SIZE MEDIUM 

116 Wet Mop Heads - 100% Cotton - Size Medium - Zone 1 NO BID

117 Wet Mop Heads - 100% Cotton - Size Medium - Zone 2 NO BID

118 Wet Mop Heads - 100% Cotton - Size Medium - Zone 3 NO BID

119 Wet Mop Heads - 100% Cotton - Size Medium - Zone 4 NO BID

120
Wet Mop Heads - 100% Cotton - Size Medium - Lost or 
Damaged Replacement Cost - All Zones NO BID

WET MOP HEADS - 100% COTTON - SIZE LARGE

121 Wet Mop Heads - 100% Cotton - Size Large - Zone 1 NO BID

122 Wet Mop Heads - 100% Cotton - Size Large - Zone 2 NO BID

123 Wet Mop Heads - 100% Cotton - Size Large - Zone 3 NO BID

124 Wet Mop Heads - 100% Cotton - Size Large - Zone 4 NO BID

125
Wet Mop Heads - 100% Cotton - Size Large - Lost or 
Damaged Replacement Cost - All Zones NO BID



WET MOP HANDLES - ZONE 1
126 Wet Mop Handles 24"  - Zone 1 NO BID
127 Wet Mop Handles 36"  - Zone 1 NO BID
128 Wet Mop Handles 48"  - Zone 1 NO BID
129 Wet Mop Handles 60"  - Zone 1 NO BID

WET MOP HANDLES - ZONE 2
130 Wet Mop Handles 24"  - Zone 2 NO BID
131 Wet Mop Handles 36"  - Zone 2 NO BID
132 Wet Mop Handles 48"  - Zone 2 NO BID
133 Wet Mop Handles 60"  - Zone 2 NO BID

WET MOP HANDLES - ZONE 3
134 Wet Mop Handles 24"  - Zone 3 AmeriPride MPWMHDL 0.25$           
135 Wet Mop Handles 36"  - Zone 3 AmeriPride MPWMHDL 0.25$           
136 Wet Mop Handles 48"  - Zone 3 AmeriPride MPWMHDL 0.25$           
137 Wet Mop Handles 60"  - Zone 3 AmeriPride MPWMHDL 0.25$           

WET MOP HANDLES - ZONE 4
138 Wet Mop Handles 24"  - Zone 4 NO BID
139 Wet Mop Handles 36"  - Zone 4 NO BID
140 Wet Mop Handles 48"  - Zone 4 NO BID
141 Wet Mop Handles 60"  - Zone 4 NO BID

WET MOP HANDLES - LOST OR DAMAGED 
REPLACEMENT COST - ALL ZONES

142
Wet Mop Handles 24"  - Lost or Damaged Replacement 
Cost - All Zones AmeriPride

MPWMHDL 16.36$         

143
Wet Mop Handles 36"  - Lost or Damaged Replacement 
Cost - All Zones AmeriPride

MPWMHDL 16.36$         

144
Wet Mop Handles 48"  - Lost or Damaged Replacement 
Cost - All Zones AmeriPride

MPWMHDL 16.36$         

145
Wet Mop Handles 60"  - Lost or Damaged Replacement 
Cost - All Zones AmeriPride

MPWMHDL 16.36$         



ZONE 1:  WEST COUNTIES: 

BUTTE 
LAWRENCE 
MEADE 
PENNINGTON 
CUSTER  
FALL RIVER 
OGLALA LAKOTA (SHANNON) 
HARDING 
PERKINS 

ZONE 2: CENTRAL COUNTIES 

CORSON 
CAMPBELL 
McPHERSON 
ZIEBACH  
DEWEY 
WALWORTH 
EDMUNDS 
HAAKON  
STANLEY  
POTTER 
FAULK 
SULLY 
HYDE 
HAND 
HUGHES 
JONES 
LYMAN 
BUFFALO 
BRULE 
JACKSON 
MELLETTE 
BENNETT 
TODD 

ZONE 3:  NORTHEAST COUNTIES 

BROWN 
MARSHALL 
ROBERTS 
DAY 
GRANT 
SPINK 
CLARK 
CODINGTON 
DEUEL 
BEADLE 
KINGSBURY 
HAMLIN 
BROOKINGS 
JERAULD 
SANBORN 
MINER 
LAKE 
MOODY 
AURORA 
DAVISON 
HANSON 

ZONE 4: SOUTHEAST COUNTIES 

TRIPP 
GREGORY 
CHARLES MIX 
DOUGLAS 
HUTCHINSON 
TURNER 
LINCOLN 
BON HOMME 
YANKTON 
CLAY 
UNION 
McCOOK 
MINNEHAHA 
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